S Saskatchewan SaskSurplus Vehicle and Equipment Sale SaskSurplus Sale No: 13
S al Ministry of Central Vehicle Agency February 18 - 25, 2009
g Sovernment 500 McLeod Street Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. C.S.T.
Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Phone: (306) 787-2062
Fax: (306) 787-2092
Dept.
Item # Sales Results - Sale # 13 Kms Serial Number  Dept. Ref. #
Regina, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, Vehicle and Equipment Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street
NOTE: Items itentified with * have been on listed on previous sales.
3.511.00 2001 Dodge RAM 1500 ext cab, SB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette,
T CVA 1204 * platform hitch, White, 224,977 3B7HC12Y41G218099 CVA 496745
2002 Dodge Caravan Grand Caravan, 7 pass, 2 side doors 3.3L, auto, air,
3,000.00 cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PW, rear tint, ABS brakes, tires P215/70R15,
CVA 1301 whl base 3030, Green, 204,775 1B4GP44R82B566146 WCL B566146
2004 Dodge Caravan Grand Caravan, 7 pass, 2 side doors 3.3L, auto, air,
5,195.49 cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PW, rear tint, ABS brakes, tires P215/70R15, whl
CVA 1302 base 3030, Blue, 204,386 1D4GP24R74B534835 WCL B534835
2004 Dodge Caravan Grand Caravan, 7 pass, 2 side doors 3.3L, auto, air,
4,900.00 cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PW, rear tint, ABS brakes, tires P215/70R15, whl
CVA 1303 base 3030, Brown, 225,340 1D4GP24R94B580313 WCL B580313
2,501.50 E 1304 2001 Chev Cavalier 2.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Grey, 193,560 3G1JC524115140408 CVA 115279
406767 £ 1305 2002 Chev Impala 3.4L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AMIFM/CD, PL, PM, PW, Grey, 201,720  2G1WF52EX29300340 CVA 311415
1,270.00 E 1306 1999 Chev Lumina 3.1L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, Blue, 206,680 2G1WL52M3X9239596 CVA 148858
178469 £ 4307 1999 Chev Lumina 3.1L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PW, Brown, 204,796  2G1WL52MXX9272739 CVA 150086
2,322.89 E 1308 2001 Chrysler Intrepid 2.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, PL, PM, PW, Grey, 199,920 2C3HH46R01H676460 CVA 311084
2,653.00 E 1309 1996 Dodge Neon 2.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, White, 88,619 1P3ES47C8TD674451 CVA 112649
1,842.96 E 1310 1997 Dodge Neon 2.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Red, 209,059 1B3ES47C7VD237643 CVA 113019
2,709.55 E 1311 1997 Dodge Neon 2.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, White, 70,996 1B3ES47C3VD289674 CVA 113373
4.800.00 2003 Chev Blazer S series, 4x4 4.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM,
SRR E 1312 PW, keyless entry, alloy wheels, White, 277,671 1GNDT13X13K100129 SP  342-035
3.305.00 1997 Chev K2500 4x4, 2 door, ext cab 6.5L turbo diesel, std 5 speed, air, cruise,
SRR E 1313 tilt, utility body, pintle bumper hitch, rear seat removed, White, 279,187 1GCGK29F2VE265198 SP  083-214
3.954.61 1998 Chev K2500 4x4, 2 door, ext cab 6.5L turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt,
= E 1314  utility body, pintle bumper hitch, rear seat removed, White, 259,773 1GCGK29F6WE192354 SP  083-241
4.075.08 1998 Chev K2500 4x4, ext cab, LB 5.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, slide-in utility CVA/ 431692/
T E 1315 topper, platform hitch, tow hooks, ladder rack, White, 241,304 1GCGK29R2WE223917 Stel 285975
5.278.08 1998 Chev K2500 4x4, ext cab, LB 5.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, slide-in utility CVA/ 431924/
S E 1316 topper, platform hitch, side stepbars, ladder rack, White, 176,029 1GCGK29R7WE222665 Stel 285977
4.076.00 1998 Chev K2500 4x4, ext cab, LB 5.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, tow hooks, CVA/ 431106/
R E 1317 platform hitch w/pintle hook, mud flaps, White, 207,597 1GCGK29R8WE223548 Stel 285955

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.



S Saskatchewan SaskSurplus Vehicle and Equipment Sale SaskSurplus Sale No: 13
S al Ministry of Central Vehicle Agency February 18 - 25, 2009
[ Sovernment 500 McLeod Street Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. C.S.T.
Regina, SK S4N 4Y1 Phone: (306) 787-2062
Fax: (306) 787-2092

Dept.

ltem # Sales Results - Sale # 13 Kms Serial Number  Dept. Ref. #

3.800.00 1999 Chev K2590 4x4, 2 door., ext cab 6.5!_ turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt,

AR E 1318 pintle bumper hitch, rear seat in place, White, 230,075 1GCGK29F0XF059925 SP  084-089
420300 £ 4319 1996 Dodge RAM 1500 4x4, LB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, platform hitch, Green, 147,781  1B7HF16YATS717451 CVA 430165
2.000.00 1996 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, club cab, SB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, ilt,

AN E 1320 platform hitch, White, 219,416 3B7HC13Y1TM173318 CVA 493387
3.500.00 1997 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, club cab, SB 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, ilt,

AN E 1321 AM/FM/cassette, platform hitch w/shank/ball, White, 235,024 1B7HC13Z21VJ591743 CVA 494229
4.850.00 2001 Dodge RAM 2500 2wd, 4 door, quad cab, LB 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt,

SRS E 1322 platform hitch, White, 196,632 1B7KC23761J244270 CVA 496380
6,439.80 2001 Dodge RAM 2500 4x4, 4 door, quad cab 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, CVA/ 432989/

E 1323 AM/FM/cassette, slide-in utility topper, platform hitch, running boards, White, 228,970 1B7KF23261J244499  Stel 216398
1,333.00 E 1324 1992 Ford F250 2wd, 2 door, reg cab 5.8L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, White, 108,684 2FTHF25HONCA27095 SP  079-127
3.872.96 1995 Ford F250 4x4, 2 door, ext cab 5.8L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, utility body, no

T E 1325 rear seat, box removed, White, 287,662 1FTHX26H1SKB53856 SP  084-056
4.078.08 1997 Ford F250 2wd, 2 door, ext cab, LB 5.8L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, slide-in utility CVA/ 494989/

R E 1326 body, ladder rack, running boards, mud flaps, White, 166,966 1FTHX25H9VEB84535 Stel 275691
5.600.00 2000 Ford F250 4x4, 4 door, ext cab 7.3L turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt, utility

SRR E 1327 body, White, 306,928 1FDNX21F4YED02045 SP  083-311

2000 Ford F250 4x4, 4 door, ext cab, SB 5.4L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, platform
6,175.00 hitch, running boards, weatherguard cross box with headache rack, 2 inside side
E 1328 rail boxes (loose), box topguard, White, 212,767 1FTNX21L1YEB89312 SE 089-528
5.000.00 2002 Ford F250 4x4, 4 door, ext cab 7.3L turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt,
SRR E 1329 platform hitch, top railguard on box (plastic), White, 328,900 1FTNX21F82EC55646 SP  091-040
2000 Ford F350 4x4, 4 door, ext cab 7.3L turbo diesel, std 5 speed, air, cruise,
6,500.00 tilt, utility body, front mount steel winch, extra mounted box LH front of body,
E 1331 White, 337,847 1FTSX31F1YEC73374 SP  084-097

493.00 1993 GMC C1500 reg cab, LB 4.3L, auto, box floor mat, fibre glass box cross

) E 1332 storage, pintle bumper hitch, White, 192,485 1GTDC14Z2PE544536 SP  061-050
320599 £ 1333 1998 GMC C2500 ext.cab, SB 5.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, platform hitch, Grey, 228,179  1GTFC29R3WE539531 CVA 495226
4.450.00 1999 GMC Sierra 2500 4x4, 2 door, ext cab, SB 5.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt,

S weatherguard side rail & cross front boxes (rusty), inside floor mount slide out

E 1334 model 308 packrat, platform hitch, rear seat removed (steel box in place), White, 211,645 1GTGK29R3XF041400 SE  089-046
6.300.00 2001 GMC Sierra 2500 4x4, 4 door, LB 6.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, platform hitch,
AR E 1335 tow hooks, 4 door step bars, Grey, 203,511 1GTHK23U41F167015 CVA 433888
Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received. 2
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2,202.00 E 1336 1997 Chev Astro 8 pass 4.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, tinted glass, White, 184,093 1GNDM19WXVB195854 CVA 184069
3.301.00 2000 Chev Astro AWD 4.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, PL, PW, cargo seperator
SR E 1337 (glass), platform hitch, roof consul, White, 207,666 1GNEL19W5YB183512 SP  331-042
1.501.00 1998 Dodge RAM 1500 Cargo, SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, platform hitch, CVA/ 414755/
T E 1339 partition, shelves, White, 196,655 2B7HB11Y5WK112131  Stel 285932
2 658.00 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 Cargo, SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, partition,
SN E 1340 shelves, pintle hook, White, 128,108 2B7HB21Y0VK557056 CVA 413260
3.200.00 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 Cargo van, SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM CVA/ 413278/
A E 1341 radio, ladder rack, metal shelving, crash barrier, White, 161,897 2B7HB21Y9VK556035 Stel 275613
2 578.08 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio, crash CVA/ 414516/
R E 1342 barrier, shelves, ladder rack, White, 126,415 2B7HB21Y8VK579757 Stel 275655
2 676.00 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 SWB, 1/2 Cargo 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, crash barrier, CVA/ 413328/
R E 1343 shelves, ladder rack, White, 118,497 2B7HB21Y1VK566199 Stel 275617
2 500.00 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 Cargo, SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, crash barrier, CVA/ 413435/
AR E 1344 shelves, ladder rack, White, 180,729 2B7HB21Y3VK566186 Stel 275615
2.150.00 1997 Dodge RAM 2500 Cargo, SWB 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, crash barrier, CVA/ 414169/
e E 1345 shelves, ladder rack, pintle hook, White, 158,465 2B7HB21Y4VK579741  Stel 275639
4.301.00 2000 GMC Safari AWD, panel van 4.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio, crash CVA/ 186932/
e E 1347 barrier, shelves, platform hitch, White, 234,799 1GTDL19W5YB540157 Stel 206278
Miscellaneous Items and Equipment at 500 McLeod Street, Regina Sask.
Retro Office Chair, Herman Miller & Charles Eames Designed Fiberglass Shell
151.01 Arm Chair 14 Chairs Available (8 dark blue, 5 orange, 1 teal) in various
’ conditions - some chairs have rips, signs of wear, etc. High Bid Receives 1st
E 1351 Choice. Please identify number of chairs wanted on bid form. JU
Seat Backseat from 2008 Chev 3/4 ton. Black fabric with grey patterned
65.00 fabric. There are 6 seats available. High Bid Receives 1st Choice. Please
E 1352 identify number of seats wanted on bid form. CVA
25.00 Seat Backseat from 2007 Dodge 3/4 ton. Grey leather in the middle of the
) seat, grey patterned fabric on either side. There are 7 seats available. High Bid
E 1353 Receives 1st Choice. Please identify number of seats wanted on bid form. CVA
42.78 Seat Buddy seat from 2008 Chev 3/4 ton. Black fabric. There is only one
) E 1354 seat available to bid on. CVA
490.00 E 1355 Tires, lot of 5, P245-65R-17, Goodyear ForTera Passenger tires CVA
40844 £ 4356  Tires, Iot of 4, LT245-70R-17, BF Goodrich Rugged Trail TA Load range E CVA
302.02 E 1357 Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Integrity Passenger tires CVA
Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received. 3
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378.00 E 1358 Tires, lot of 4, P265-70R-17, Goodyear Wrangler ST Passenger tires CVA
160.01 E 1359 Tires, lot of 4, P205-60R-16, Goodyear Eagle GT Passenger tires CVA
No bid E 1360 Tires, lot of 5, P205-60R-16, Goodyear Eagle LS Passenger tires CVA
200.00 E 1361 Tires, lot of 5, P205-60R-16, Goodyear Eagle GT Passenger tires CVA
221.00 E 1362 Tires, lot of 4, P205-65R-15, Goodyear Regatta Passenger tires CVA
268.00 Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Integrity Passenger tires, like new
) E 1363 condition CVA
Desk, Metal Wood grain top. Has 2 drawers on the right side, run-off
No bid attachment with drawers on the left side. Sliding keyboard tray attached
underneath desk. These desks are available for DIRECT SALE at $25.00 each.
E 1364 First come first serve while quantities last. STSC
Desk, Metal Wood grain top. Has 2 drawers on the right side, 3 drawers on
25.00 the left side. These desks are available for DIRECT SALE at $25.00 each. First
E 1366 come first serve while quantities last. JU
Desk, Metal Wood grain top. Has 3 drawers on the left side with run-off
25.00 attachment. These desks are available for DIRECT SALE at $25.00 each. First
E 1367 come first serve while quantities last. JU
Desk, Metal Wood grain top. Has 2 drawers on the right side, 3 drawers on
25.00 the left side. These desks are available for DIRECT SALE at $25.00 each. First
E 1368 come first serve while quantities last. JU
Desk, Metal Wood grain top. Has 2 drawers on the right side, 3 drawers on
25.00 the left side. These desks are available for DIRECT SALE at $25.00 each. First
E 1369 come first serve while quantities last. JU
La Ronge, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, La Ronge
For viewing by appointment only contact Norm Dyck (306) 425-4578
277.00 Boat Motor 1982 Evinrude outboard motor, 25 HP (cowling is for 20 HP),
) E 1371 Model E25RCTE C7164789 ENV
Makwa Lake Provincial Park, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Tourism, Parks, Culture & Sport, Makwa Lake
For viewing by appointment only contact John Luker (306) 837-2410
1.276.08 1985 Chev C30/3500 2wd, 1 ton, 2 door 5.7L, 8'x 10' grain box and hoist,
S E 1372 duals, tires 235-85R16, White, 150,906 1GBHC34M4FJ160379 TPCS T6102
100 £ 4373 Fuel Tank with Stand, 200 Gallon FT15 TPCS
38800 £ 4374 Fuel Tank with Stand, 500 Gallon FT16 TPCS
Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received. 4
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923.75 . . . .
E 1375 Trailer, 1974 Princess Auto with Box & Hoist  Green, 1501038 TPCS
1.200.00 Boat, 1976 Sprungbok with Trailer & Motor Boat trailer included, 1973 20 HP Trailer HO466, motor
S E 1376 Johnson motor included 583307 TPCS
Prince Albert, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, Radio Technical Services, 530 - 18th Street East, Prince Albert
For viewing by appointment only contact Brian Taillon (306) 953-3650
35004202, 35003534,
35003554, 35001725,
800.00 35001822, 35003582,
E 1377 Mobile Radios Lot of 8 Uniden Mobile Radios, Model IMH4100D 35004336, 35003786 ENV
Receivers - 8469, 8811,
8842, 6019, Modem -
No bid . . . . . . . 001 6.66714U’ LNB
Satellite Equipment Lot of satellite equipment - includes 4 Caifornia Satellite - 02104898,
Microwave EDB-1000 satellite receivers, 1 satellite modem, 1 LNB satellite, and Comtech modems -
E 1378 2 Comtech L Band satellite modems 22087733, 22088010 ENV
UPS power supplies -
PB0049122087,
No bid . . . . PBOO49132467,'SincIair
Satellite Power Supplies Lot of 5 power supplies - includes 2 UPS-APC300 power supplies -
(uninterruptible power supplies), 2 Sinclair power supplies, 1 other power supply 4234211, 9219004,
E 1379 (unknown make) unknown - 329 ENV
Satellite Dish Front End Equipment Lot of satellite dish front end equipment - Norsat - 86N0O4622342,
No bid includes 3 Norsat C-Band LNB (low noise block converters) and 9 support arms 86N04624732,
E 1380 from a satellite 92N0462177 ENV
31.00 Diplexer WB-3493, RF
) E 1381 Diplexer F150-4F and RF filter Lot of 1 Sinclair Diplexer and 1 RF filter Filter WF2294 ENV
No bid E 1382 Smoke Absorbers Lot of 5 Weller desk-top smoke absorbers WSA350 ENV
No bid Power Meter/Watt Meter Lot of 1 RF power meter (10-25 watts) and 1 RF Power meter JA392/071,
E 1383 watt meter SWR watt meter AEPL893 ENV
No bid E 1384 Frequency Counter Hewlett Packard 5303B 525 Mhz Counter ENV
No bid E 1385 Vega Boards Lot of 2 Vega boards (model RP-223) audio bridge ENV
Receive/Transmit Board & Power Amp Lot of 4 UHF Motorola MSR2000
No bid (receive/transmit board & 30 watt power amp), 414 / 419 Mhz - No channel
E 1386 elements ENV

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.
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260.00 . . 154SRG1061,
) E 1387 Base Radios Lot of 2 Motorola Desk Trac VHF base radio 154SRG1062 ENV
Prince Albert, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, Prince Albert
For questions please contact Tim Neuman (306) 953-2959.
Viewing of items is scheduled for Friday, February 20 from 1-5pm at 63-12th Street East, Prince Albert.
Sorry, other viewing times are not available.
207.00 Ice Auger Barracuda Plus 8" Ice Auger Model 9000B c/w Tecumseh 85cc
) E 1388 motor YTXS50855DA ENV
307.00 E 1389 Ice Auger Eskimo 8" Ice Auger Model #9850 c/w 3 HP Tecumseh motor 13537 ENV
Prince Albert, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, Highways Repair Yard, 81 North Industrial Drive, Prince Albert
For viewing by appointment only contact Colin Trudel (306) 953-2703
1,078.08 1995 Ford F350 2wd, 1 ton, crew cab, 2 door 7.3L turbo diesel, 5 speed std,
E 1390 Flatdeck with hoist, duals on rear, GVW 4535, wheel base 428, Yellow, 143,375 1FDJW35F2SEA51048 CVA 514448
10,200
hours
1,100.00 1996 Ford F350 2wd, 1 ton, crew cab, 2 door 7.3L turbo diesel, 5 speed std, air, (odometer
cruise, tilt, Flatdeck with hoist, duals on rear, rotary lights, GVW 4535, wheel reading not
E 1391 base 428, 225 HP, Yellow, available) 1FDJW35F0TEB59928 CVA 514570
5.000.00 2004 Ford E350 Super Duty, 15 pass 6.0L diesel, auto, air, Cargo divider, winter
AR E 1392 front, tires 245-75R16 White, 175,430 1FBSS31P24HA89260 CVA 422253
850.00 2001 GMC Savana 15 pass 6.5L turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Cargo divider,
E 1393 running boards, tires 245-75R16 White, 244,643 1GJHG39F711213927 CVA 421636
Saskatoon, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, Highways Compound, 105th Street, Saskatoon
For viewing by appointment only contact Garth Haugen (306) 933-6240
Boat ZEB96022M96G,
2,500.00 Boat, 1986 Evanol Big E Duro Craft with Trailer & Motor 1974 Boat trailer Trailer 400133, Motor
E 1394 included, 1985 50 HP Mercury motor included, 7209932 ENV
Saskatoon, Saskatchewan - SaskEnergy, Saskatoon
For viewing by appointment only contact Kelly Cameron (306) 975-8583
Small Building Measures 3.65 m x 3.65 m (approximately 12' x 12'),
388.00 approximately 3.0 m (9.8'") high-with peak of 3.65 m (12'). 1 door w/window, plus
E 1395 another window. Building located at NE 26 - 38 - 05 W3. SE

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received. 6
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Smoothstone Lake, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, located near Smoothstone Lake, north off Highway 937

For viewing by appointment only contact Matthew Burtney (306) 953-2299, Chris Brown 953-2879 or Marty Ferguson 953-2670

Wood 288.243 m3 of H3 wood, 211.367 m3 of H4 wood, 3.173 m3 of H1 &

No bid E 1260 * H2 wood, all wood is in tree length form =

Visit our web site at WWW.SA@SKSUIPIUS.Ca for details and pictures of the items listed above.
Offer to Purchase, Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received. 7



