
SaskSurplus Vehicle and  Equipment Sale
Central Vehicle Agency

500 McLeod Street
Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale No:7
August 26 - September 2, 2009

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. C.S.T.
Phone: (306) 787-2062

Fax: (306) 787-2092

Item #
                                          Final Sales Results - Sale # 7
WD - Withdrawn Kms Serial Number Dept.

 

1,126.00 E 701
1999 Chevrolet Cavalier  2.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Front bucket seats with console shift, 
Green, 211,264 1G1JC524XX7250509 CVA

1,857.00 E 702 1999 Chevrolet Cavalier  2.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio,  Red, 203,276 1G1JC5247X7248488 CVA

1,250.00 E 703
2002 Chevrolet Impala (TOW ONLY) 3.4L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM, PW,  
dual temperature control, Brown, 212,114 2G1WF52E629367341 CVA

2,751.00 E 704
2002 Chevrolet Impala  3.4L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM, PW,  dual 
temperature control, Brown, 204,305 2G1WF52EX29305425 CVA

1,117.00 E 705 1999 Chevrolet Lumina  3.1L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PW,  Blue, 181,710 2G1WL52M4X9238957 CVA

2,500.00 E 706 1999 Chevrolet Lumina  3.1L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PW,  Brown, 118,995 2G1WL52M2X9256194 CVA

2,727.00 E 707
2002 Chevrolet Malibu  3.1L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL,  Front bucket seats with 
console shift, Green, 183,939 1G1ND52J12M662025 CVA

858.00 E 708
1997 Chrysler Intrepid  3.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PM, PW, front 
bucket seats with consol shift, White, 235,858 2C3HH46TXVH732891 CVA

1,700.00 E 615 *
2000 Chrysler Intrepid  2.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PM, PW, Power 
trunk release, Beige, 217,103 2C3HH46R3YH385431 CVA

3,101.00 E 617 *
2004 Chrysler Sebring  2.7L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM, PW,  Power trunk 
release, Grey/silver, 176,993 1C3EL46R54N153870 CVA

1,607.09 E 709 1998 Dodge Neon  2.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Front bucket seats with console shift, White, 140,305 1B3ES47C5WD690502 CVA

1,856.00 E 625 *
2000 Ford Crown Victoria  4.6L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, PL, PM, PW, Front bucket seats, 
driver's side power seat, White, 213,454 2FAFP71W9YX177473 CVA

12,650.77
E 710

1988 Ford F800  7.0L (429 CID), 5 speed standard with 2 speed axle, AM/FM radio, Utility 
body, T3000 Telelect manlift (3.6 foot lift, has jib), tires 10x20 Load F - 12 ply, GVW 
20,000, dual fuel tanks. 33,789 1FDPF82KXJVA03160 STEL

817.77
E 711

1993 Chevrolet K3500 1 ton, 4x4, 2 door (TOW ONLY) 5.7L, 4 speed standard, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM radio, single bench in cab, has toolbox in box, White, 191,415 1GBHK34K8PE231742

AG 
Pastur

es

5,101.01

E 712

2003 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 4x4, 4 door, ext cab, short box 5.3L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
Platform hitch, tinted glass, front bucket seats with buddy seat/console, side step bars, bug 
deflector, grille inserts, tow hooks, mud flaps, Jensen inverter (300 watt),  Grey, 213,899 2GCEK19T631367724 CVA

2,801.00 E 713
1999 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, ext cab, short box 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM 
radio, platform hitch, headache rack, Red, 149,793 3B7HC12Y4XG202171 CVA

Regina, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, Vehicle and Equipment Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street         
    NOTE:  Items itentified with  *  have been on listed on previous sales.         
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2,560.00 E 634 *
2001 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 4 door, quad cab, long box 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, mudflaps,  White, 221,046 1B7HC13Y91J603154 CVA

1,994.00
E 714

2001 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, ext cab, short box 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, platform hitch with shank & ball, plastic Delta crossbox toolbox, 
aluminum headache rack with rotating light, White, 294,034 3B7HC12Y21G218103 CVA

1,553.00 E 715
2001 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, regular cab, long box 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, Raider topper (with side sliding glass), White, 245,537 1B7HC16Y41S264390 CVA

3,737.37 E 716
2001 Dodge RAM 1500 4x4, 4 door, quad cab, short box, 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, tow hooks, mud flaps, White, 208,145 1B7HF13Z61J589522 CVA

2,818.00
E 717

2001 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 4 door, quad cab, short box, 5.2L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, front bucket seats with buddy seat, mud flaps, box liner,  
Green, 198,257 1B7HC13Y01J590990 CVA

3,715.00 E 719
2001 Dodge RAM 2500 2wd, 2 door, regular cab, long box 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
Platform hitch, grille inserts,  White, 187,493 3B7KC26Z51M258059 CVA

1,886.00
E 720

2001 Dodge RAM 2500 2wd, 4 door, quad cab, short box 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Front bucket seats with buddy seat, grille inserts, bug deflector, front seat 
covers, box liner, mud flaps,   White, 223,049 1B7KC23Z51J586003 CVA

4,990.00
E 637 *

2004 Ford F150 2wd, 4 door, ext cab, short box 4.6L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, mudflaps, Pace Edwards roll top, tinted rear glass,  
White, 184,862 2FTRX17W84CA65261 CVA

3,210.98 E 721 1995 Ford F250 4x4, 2 door, super cab 5.8L, auto,  utility body, White, 205,826 1FTHX26H9SKB91268 STEL

1,710.00
E 722

1997 Ford F250 2wd, 2 door, ext cab, long box 5.8L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, cabinets in cab 
(no rear seats), front bucket seats with small storage console between seats, running 
boards, pintle hook, mud flaps,  White, 147,586 1FTHX25HXVEC14626

CVA/S
tel

1,595.00 E 723
1997 Ford F250 2wd, 2 door, regular cab, long box 4.6L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Platform hitch, box rail protectors,  White, 189,532 1FTEF2765VKD42257 CVA

1,676.00
E 724

1997 Ford F250 2wd, 2 door, ext cab, long box, 5.8L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, Mud flaps, 
pintle hook, front bucket seats with center storage console between seats, cab length 
running boards, White, 167,546 1FTHX25H4VEB84538 CVA

1,875.00 E 725
1993 Ford F350 4x4, 4 door, crew cab, long box (TOW ONLY) 5.8L, auto, air, platform 
hitch, running boards, White, 167,460 2FTJW36H2PCB14036 CVA

1,511.00
E 726

1994 GMC Sierra 2500 4x4, 2 door, regular cab (FOR PARTS ONLY) 5.7L, auto,  flat 
deck, headache rack, has ball/hitch in middle of deck, pintle hitch, single bench in cab, 
White, 273,263 1GTGK24K9RE552130

AG 
Pastur

es

1,655.00
E 727

1997 GMC Sierra 2500 4x4, 2 door, ext cab 5.7L vortec, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio, 
bucket seats with backseat, metal box console, White, 256,953 1GTGK29R7VE551395

AG 
Pastur

es

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  2
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2,350.00
E 728

1998 GMC Sierra 3500 2wd, 4 door, crew cab, long box, 5.7L, auto,  air, cruise, tilt, 
Platform hitch, front & rear bench seats with fold down arm rests, front mud flaps, box 
rails, Green, 205,306 1GTGC33R9WF035594 CVA

1,236.00 E 729
1998 Dodge Caravan 7 passenger 3.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, clear view partition, tinted 
glass, roof rack, White, 205,122 2B4GP24R4WR759776

CVA/S
tel

1,800.00 E 730
1998 Dodge Caravan 7 passenger, 3 door 3.0L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, PM, Front bucket 
seats, roof rack,  Green, 151,025 2B4FP2532WR721842 CVA

1,225.00 E 731
1998 Dodge Caravan 7 passenger 3.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio, PM, roof rack, 
Green, 163,483 2B4FP2532WR721839 CVA

1,818.00 E 732
1999 Dodge Caravan 7 passenger 3.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PM, 
PW, Roof rack,  Blue, 214,564 2B4FP2535XR408723 CVA

549.00 E 733
1999 Plymouth Voyager 7 passenger, 3 door (TOW ONLY) 3.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM radio, PL, PM, PW, Roof rack, power reat vent windows,  White, 188,129 2P4FP2532XR354912 CVA

3,000.00 E 734
2002 Dodge Caravan 7 passenger, 4 door 3.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM, 
PW,  Platform hitch, roof rack, tinted glass,  Red, 192,724 1B4GP25R12B665913 CVA

4,100.00 E 735
2004 Dodge Caravan Grand 3.3L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/CD, PL, PM, rear tint, 
Blue/Grey, 206,072 1D4GP24R64B589843 WCL

1,078.08 E 736
1998 Dodge RAM 1500 Cargo, SWB, 3 door 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, crash barrier, 
shelves both sides, ladder rack, platform hitch, mud flaps,  White, 203,184 2B7HB11Y7WK112132

CVA/S
tel

1,257.57
E 737

2000 Dodge RAM 1500 Cargo, SWB, 3 door 5.2L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, 
crash barrier, shelves both sides, ladder rack, platform hitch, mud flaps, storage console 
loose in back,  White, 242,444 2B7HB11Y2YK145090

CVA/S
tel

322.00
E 269 *

1997 Dodge RAM 2500 Cargo, SWB, 3 door (TOW ONLY) 5.2L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, ladder rack, crash barrier, map box, shelves both sides, mud flaps, pintle 
hook, White, 102,660 2B7HB21Y6VK566182

CVA/S
tel

1,651.00 E 738 1995 Dodge RAM 3500 5 passenger with rear cargo area, 5.9L, auto, air,  Blue, 186,194 2B5WB35Z2SK540652 CVA

1,811.00 E 739
1998 Dodge RAM 3500 15 passenger, 3 door, 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, 
Platform hitch, Grey, 146,533 2B5WB35Z3WK117486 CVA

533.00
E 740

1998 Dodge RAM 3500 15 passenger (TOW ONLY) 5.9L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, 
AM/FM/cassette, Hitch with ball, White, 146,247 2B5WB35Z0WK143737 CVA

1,269.69 E 741
2001 Dodge RAM 3500 15 passenger 5.9L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, 
Platform hitch,   Grey, 124,264 2B5WB35Z71K542721 CVA

1,203.00 E 653 *
2004 Ford E350 XL SuperDuty, 15 passenger 5.4L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM radio, 
Platform hitch,  Blue, 171,820 1FBSS31LX4HA82148 CVA

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  3
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5,101.01

E 742

1998 GMC Savana Cargo, LWB, 3 door 6.5L turbo diesel, auto, air, cruise, tilt, Fibre van, 
insulated walls, counter & cabinets, shelves, ladder rack, partition barrier, storage console 
between front seats, mud flaps, extended rear bumper with pintle hook, tailgate access 
door, White, 149,391 1GTHG39F8W1077631

CVA/S
tel

4,125.00 E 654 * 2003 GMC Savana 15 passenger 6.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt,  White, 181,217 1GJHG39U431227169 CVA
879.00 E 743 1996 Plymouth Voyager 3 door,  3.0L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt, PM, Roof rack,  Green, 236,579 2P4FP2531TR753451 CVA

2,250.00 E 744
1999 Plymouth Voyager 7 passenger 3.0L, auto, air, cruise, tilt, AM/FM/cassette, PL, PM, 
PW, Roof rack,  Green, 188,684 2P4FP2539XR351599 CVA

     Miscellaneous Items and Equipment at 500 McLeod Street, Regina Sask.        

100.00 E 745
   Deionization System    Deionization system, Barnstead Thermolyne Corporation, 
NANOpure Infinity UF, model D8981, received in 1999 898990339650 AG

33.33 E 746
   Deionization System    Deionization system, Barnstead Thermolyne Corporation, 
NANOpure Infinity UF, model D8981, received in 1999 898990339648 AG

225.00 E 747
   Reverse Osmosis System    Reverse Osmosis System, Barnstead Thermolyne 
Corporation, Rppure Infinity Premier, model D9011, purchased in 1999 901990651193 AG

68.45 E 748    Amber Rotating Light    Amber rotating light with 12V plug-cord (magnetic) CVA
WD 126.05 E 749    Booster Kit    Barton Earle booster kit, multi-start 350, Kohlea engine K181T STEL

433.00
E 750

   Cable Dolly with Reel Carrier    1976 homebuilt flat deck/cable dolly with reel carrier, 4' x 
10' flat deck with full ramp and drop-down loading gate, tires P205-75R15, GVW 2,500 lbs. SASK90577000157 STEL

WD 235.00 E 751
   Fuel Tank    Diesel fuel tank for 4000 Series International 3-5 ton trucks, 54 gallon step 
tank 244YT5020543095 STEL

333.00 E 752
   Generator    1999 AG-Tronic gas generator, model GN602400AC, 5,000 watt, 8 HP 
Briggs & Stratton, pull start engine. 061399N181590 STEL

233.00 E 753
   Generator    1990 AG-Tronic gas generator, model 513051, 3,250 watt, 8 HP Briggs & 
Stratton model 195437, code 8311712, electric or pull start engine. 841502 STEL

WD 21.00 E 754    Hand Pump for Circuit Testing    Hydraulic hand pump for circuit testing STEL
56.00 E 755    Headache Rack    Shop built headache rack with amber rotating light CVA

228.23 E 756    Hydraulic Filter Buggy    Hydraulic filter buggy with filter with electric motor STEL
66.00 E 757    Jack    GM jack CVA

169.00 E 758    Jack, Air    Blackhawk 67415 air jack, 20 ton FK09251 STEL
137.50 E 759    Jack, Floor    Blackhawk SJ-3 floor jack, 2 ton DB59842 STEL

71.99 E 760    Jack, Hydraulic    Blue Giant manual hydraulic jack 83102105 SLGA
88.88 E 761    Jack, Hydraulic    Mobile Industries manual hydraulic jack, model ML55 36475 SLGA

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  4
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WD 165.00 E 762    Jacks    Lot of 4 jacks for installation & removal of Dakota Fibrobec Space Cap toppers STEL
19.99 E 763    Measure Master    Rolotape measure master (in meters) CVA

410.00 E 764
   Rock & Frost Bucket for Tractor    Hensley 18" rock and frost bucket, removed from 310 
John Deere, fits Case also STEL

207.20 E 765
   Rolling Shelf    Blue steel rolling shelf with 5 shelves, each shelf measures 31" x 62" x 
69" high STEL

50.00 E 766
   Plate Glass    Lot of 6 sheets of plate glass.  4 sheets measure 35" x 80", one sheet 
measures 25.5" x 80", one sheet measures 15.75" x 72.25" GS

200.00 E 767    Tailgate for Dodge Dakota Truck    Tailgate for late 1990's Dodge Dakota truck CVA
37.00 E 768    Tailgate for Dodge Dakota Truck    Tailgate for late 1990's Dodge Dakota truck CVA

125.00 E 769    Tailgate for Dodge Truck    Tailgate for late 1990's Dodge full-size pickup truck CVA
301.01 E 770    Tailgate for Dodge Truck    Tailgate for late 1990's Dodge full-size pickup truck CVA

130.00 E 771
   Tires & Rims, Miscellaneous    Lot of miscellaneous tires, includes (4) LT245-75R-16, (2) 
P225-60R-16, and (2) miscellaneous rims CVA

465.00 E 772    Tires, lot of 4, LT275-65R-18, Continental Contitrac     CVA
78.70 E 773    Tires, lot of 4, P195-60R-15, Continental Touring Contact AS     CVA

WD 56.00 E 774    Tires, lot of 4, P205-70R-15, Goodyear Integrity - WITHDRAWN FROM SALE     CVA
NO BID E 775    Tires, lot of 4, P215-60R-17, Bridgestone Turanza EL 400     CVA
100.00 E 776    Tires, lot of 4, P215-70R-15, Goodyear Integrity     CVA

WD 21.00 E 777    Tires, lot of 4, P215-70R-15, Goodyear Integrity - WITHDRAWN FROM SALE     CVA
125.00 E 778    Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Integrity     CVA
124.00 E 779    Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Regatta 2     CVA
251.00 E 780    Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Ultragrip Ice     CVA
212.88 E 781    Tires, lot of 4, P225-60R-16, Goodyear Ultragrip Ice     CVA
201.00 E 782    Tires, lot of 4, P245-65R-17, Goodyear Fortera HL     CVA
326.00 E 783    Tires, lot of 4, P245-65R-17, Goodyear Fortera HL     CVA
150.00 E 784    Tires, lot of 4, P245-70R-17, General Americtrac     CVA

NO BID E 785    Tires, lot of 4, P245-70R-17, General Americtrac     CVA
NO BID E 786    Tires, lot of 4, P255-70R-17, General Americtrac TR     CVA
NO BID E 787    Tires, lot of 4, P255-70R-17, General Americtrac TR     CVA
525.51 E 788    Tires, lot of 4, P265-70R-17, Goodyear Wrangler ATS     CVA
501.00 E 789    Tires, lot of 4, P265-70R-17, Goodyear Wrangler ATS     CVA

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  5
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272.75 E 790    Tires, lot of 4, ST225-75R-16, Goodyear Wrangler     CVA
205.00 E 791    Tires, lot of 4, ST225-75R-16, Goodyear Wrangler     CVA
183.58 E 792    Tires, lot of 4, ST225-75R-16, Goodyear Wrangler     CVA
416.00 E 793    Tires, lot of 4, ST225-75R-16, Goodyear Wrangler     CVA

2,257.00 E 794
   Trailer    Flat deck tandem axle trailer, 12' x 6' deck with ramps, tires LT245-75R16, 6 
ply, GVW 14,000 lbs. Green, 2L914GB27PH00312 STEL

1,861.00 E 795
   Trailer    1986 Mallard flat deck tandem axle trailer, 12' x 6' deck with ramps, tires LT245-
75R16 Load E, GVW 14,000 lbs. 2D94F7EE2G1010837 STEL

259.00 E 796
   Trailer with Reel Carrier    1978 homebuilt flat deck trailer with reel carrier, 4' x 10' flat 
deck, no ramps, tires P195-75R14, GVW 2,500 lbs. SASK90578003134 STEL

WD 533.00
E 797    Truck Box    Truck box from 2009 Ford F150, short box 

AG 
Pastur

es
76.00 E 798    Truck Toolbox    Aluminum side mount toolbox, measures 60" x 12" x 12" CVA

276.50 E 799    Truck Toolbox    Lot of 2 Weatherguard side toolboxes CVA

253.00 E 7102
   Truck Topper    Arrow truck topper, model 608, white with tinted glass with side sliding 
glass, measures 100" x 72" x 69.5" 105308 CVA

149.89 E 7103    Warwick Ladder Bucket    Warwick ladder style TTS-20, cable fiberglass man bucket STEL

31.00 E 7104    Warwick Ladder Bucket    Warwick ladder style TTS-20, cable fiberglass man bucket STEL
HUMBOLDT, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, Humboldt        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Bruce McLarty or Karl Breker (306) 682-6726        

357.57 E 7105
   Trailer    1977 Wilger ST200 utility trailer with tilting deck, measures 7' wide x 8' long, 1 
7/8" hitch, 13" wheels with bearing buddies, spare tire included 107719 ENV
MEADOW LAKE, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, 720 5th Street West, Meadow Lake        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Tara Gower (306) 240-6929        

376.00 E 7106
   Snowblower Attachment    Snowblower attachment, fits a 1987 John Deere F915 front 
mower M01080X555134 GS

223.00 E 7107    Sweeper Attachment    Sweeper attachment, fits a 1987 John Deere F915 front mower TY0246B955881 GS

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  6
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MELVILLE, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Environment, Melville        
     For viewing by appointment only contact the Melville office (Phil, Andy or Donna) (306) 728-7480        

NO BID E 660 *
   Grass Bagger for Riding Lawnmower    Arien grass bagger for riding lawnmower, model 
827020 8380 ENV

NO BID E 662 *    Pressure Washer    Portable pressure washer, model Y-81, 1 HP electric motor 100243T ENV
NO BID E 663 *    Fertilizer Spreader     ENV
NO BID E 664 *    Van Safety Screens     ENV

MOOSE JAW, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, Highways Fleet Services, Moose Jaw        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Rod Jenkins (306) 694-3773 or Bob Bertolo (306) 694-3775        

WD 751.00 E 718
2001 Dodge RAM 1500 2wd, 2 door, club cab, short box, 5.2L,  auto, air, cruise, tilt,  
Yellow/black, 266,784 3B7HC12Y91G218101 CVA
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Highways, Prince Albert Repair Depot, 81 N Ind Drive, Prince Albert        
   For viewing by appointment only contact Colin Trudel (306) 953-2703, Jason Hradecki (306) 960-5152 or Tim Earing (306) 953-278

168.00 E 586 *    V-Plow    V-Plow Champion Dominion Road Machinery 749001250 HI

45.45

E 592 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #1)    JD bushings, JD cylinders, JD 
644 lower, JD sleeves, industrial hydraulic oil, cable assembly for Mack truck, antenna 
wires from Cat grader, Ford solenoid, various metal parts, operators manual for dresser 
engines HI

85.00
E 593 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #2)    Red and amber led lights 3"x7", 
LHA suction strainer, light mounts, assorted wires in wire loom, ZEP 5110 filter cartridge, 
push-pull cables HI

87.00

E 594 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #3)    AF982M Fleetguard air filter, 
Dot41 lights, Stemco muffler, 3/4" and 7/8" nuts, 3/4"x2 1/4" carriage bolts, 3/4"x2 1/2" 
carriage bolts, 3/4"x4" carriage bolts, 3/4"x4 1/2" carriage bolts, box of assorted nuts and 
bolts HI

46.00

E 595 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #4)    Wilson alternator 8AR2015K for 
JD, 16" rim, pipe fittings, light mounting brackets, red LED perimeter 3"x7", code 3 Dot41 
light, industrial hydraulic oil, repairable floor jack, heavy duty eye hole bracket HI

55.55

E 596 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #5)    Kralinator L802 and FS244 oil 
filters, Fleetguard air filters, Donaldson air filters, Wix and Baldwin air filters, 3/4" wire 
loom, ferry blue and signal red cans of paint, primer, maxim alkaline based cleaner, 
Purolator pure air filter, mounting apparatus HI

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  7
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Central Vehicle Agency

500 McLeod Street
Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale No:7
August 26 - September 2, 2009

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. C.S.T.
Phone: (306) 787-2062

Fax: (306) 787-2092

Item #
                                          Final Sales Results - Sale # 7
WD - Withdrawn Kms Serial Number Dept.

92.00

E 597 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #6)    Assorted Kralinator and 
Donaldson oil filters, multi tool holder pegs, 1/2" and 3/4" wire loom, 5 gallon pail of nuts 
and bolts, Federal Mogul oil seal, air filter, 5/16" 3/8" and 7/16" synflex hose, Triwest tire 
liner HI

115.00

E 598 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #7)    14" and 15" wiper blades, Cole 
Hersee circuit breakers, radiators, rotating roof lights, light bar mounts, Hella head lamps, 
protective caps for 175 amp safe-mate conn, pulley, chain, wire, brass fittings, Zerostart 
heavy duty block heater, assorted trail HI

85.85
E 599 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #8)    Detroit Diesel remanufactured 
injectors, mats, various gaskets, various machine/hydraulics parts, mercury lamp bulbs, 
synflex hoses, wire loom HI

85.02
E 5101 *

   Miscellaneous Highways Equipment Parts (pallet #9)    Gates & John Deere belts, 
assorted red and orange light covers, revolving lights, gaskets, large sprocket, Fuller 
transmission parts, light mounting brackets, Meritor ABS sensor kit, air filter HI
REGINA, Saskatchewan - Ministry of Government Services, Executive Air/Air Ambulance, Hangar #4, Regina Airport        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Dave Wilson (306) 787-9450        

8,176.00 E 601 *
   Piper Cheyenne Aircraft Propeller    Hartzell aircraft propeller, model HC-B3TN-3K, new 
blades installed, TTSO 0.0 hours, removed from Piper PA42-720 Cheyenne IIIA. BUA21669 GS
SASKATOON, Ministry of Agriculture, Saskatoon        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Norm Kohle (306) 933-5299 cell (306) 221-1991        

1,178.08
E 7108    Truck Topper    Space Kap truck topper, fits 8' truck box 

AG 
Pastur

es

NO BID
E 7109    Truck Topper    Raider truck topper, fits 8' truck box 

AG 
Pastur

es

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  8



SaskSurplus Vehicle and  Equipment Sale
Central Vehicle Agency

500 McLeod Street
Regina, SK  S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale No:7
August 26 - September 2, 2009

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. C.S.T.
Phone: (306) 787-2062

Fax: (306) 787-2092

Item #
                                          Final Sales Results - Sale # 7
WD - Withdrawn Kms Serial Number Dept.
SASKATOON, Ministry of Corrections, Public Safety and Policing, 910 - 60th Street East, Saskatoon        
     For viewing by appointment only contact Nancy Joel (306) 956-8835        

533.00 E 7110
1992 Ford F350 2wd, 4 door, crew cab (TOW ONLY) 7.5L, 5 speed standard, air, cruise, 
tilt, dual tanks, White, 268,833 2FTJW35G8NCA90136 CPSP

136.00 E 7111
   Boilers    Lot of 2 boilers, model 824WTD natural gas, BTU 165,000 Raytherm 66 square 
foot heating surface, CPSP

2,777.77 E 7112
   Tractor    John Deere industrial tractor, 3 cylinder, type 1152DT, homemade cab & 
loader with bucket, CPSP

65.00 E 7113    Trailer    Trailer with reels, 2 wheel CPSP
101.00 E 7114    Water Wagon    Water wagon with tank CPSP

Offer to Purchase, Bid Forms  are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca 
or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot located at 500 McLeod Street, Regina  SK.
In Regina, bids may be deposited in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot located at 500 McLeod Street.
Bids can also be submitted by fax to (306)787-2092; by phone (306)787-2062 or (306)787-2238. 
or by mail, addressed to:  Ministry of Government Services, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina SK  S4N 4Y1.
* If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.
* Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.
* It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase to Purchase, Bid Form.

Visit our web site at www.SaskSurplus.ca for details and pictures of the items listed above.

Government Services reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase received.  9


